


VARIEGATED 
THISTLE 
( continued) 

covering. They are 
equipped with a 
··parachute'" of hairs about
2 cm long.
Seeds are set in summer.
They are too big to be
blown far by the wind
despite the "parachute",
and most seeds fall onto
the bare ground at the
base of the dead parent

pl,mt. 
Variegated thistle seed 
can remain dormant in 
the soil for up to nine 
years. The percentage 
germination of seed varies. 
from year to year and 
can be less than 50 per 
cent. The worst 
infestations occur in those 
years when the ground is 

bare in autumn, as there is 
little competition for the 
weed seedlings. Several 
germinations of Variegated 
thistle seed can occur in 
the one year, which makes 
control more difficult. 
Prompt action is essential 
to eradicate isolated 
patches of Variegated 
thistle to prevent the weed 

getting established in a 
new area. 
For information Oil 

Variegated thistle contml 
contact the Agriculture 
Protection Board: 
Telephone Perth 67 OJ 11 
or any coulltry office of 
the Agriculture Protection 
Board or Department of 
Agriculture. 


